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329pp , with numerous photographs in black and white within texto..SOBRE
AUTHOR :: Clara Campoamor Rodriguez (Madrid , 12 February 18881 -
Lausanne , April 30 19722 3) was a Spanish politician , defender of the rights of
women and main promoter of women's suffrage in Spain , achieved in 1931 , and
first exercised by women in elections 1933..Al proclamation of the Second
Republic , Clara Campoamor was elected MP ( in 1931 women could be elected,
but not be choosers ) by the Radical Party, which he had joined for having
proclaimed it " republican, liberal, secular and democratic " constants of their
own political ideology. It was part of the Constitutional Commission to prepare
the draft of the Constitution of the new republic composed of 21 deputies. In that
body he struggled to establish non- discrimination on grounds of sex, the legal
equality of children born within and outside marriage , divorce and universal
suffrage , often called " women's vote " . Got everything except regarding the
vote, which had to be debated in the Spanish Cortes . The left, with the exception
of a group of socialists and some Republicans , did not want women would vote
because it was assumed that he was very influenced by the Church and vote for
the right. Therefore, the Radical Socialist Party faced another recognized deputy
Clara , Victoria Kent, contrary to vote for women . The final debate held on
October 1 was an event . Campoamor was considered successful, and
consequently, the adoption of Article 34 which enabled women's suffrage was
achieved with 161 votes in favor, 121 against. It had the support of most of the
Socialist Party , with some important exceptions such as Indalecio Prieto , much
of the right, almost all Members of Republican Left of Catalonia and small
groups as progressive Republicans and the Association of Defense of the
Republic . Republican Action Against the Radical Socialist Party were positioned
and what more could antagonize Clara, the Radical Party itself bu
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